
AGENDA 

SULPHUR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 

TUESDAY, JANUARY 14, 2020 AT 5:30 P.M. 

  

THERE WILL BE A REGULAR MEETING OF THE SULPHUR CITY COUNCIL 

TUESDAY, JANUARY 14, 2020 AT 5:30 P.M., IN THE COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

LOCATED AT 500 NORTH HUNTINGTON STREET, SULPHUR, LOUISIANA, TO 

DISCUSS AND ADOPT THE FOLLOWING: 

  

CALL TO ORDER 

INVOCATION 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

ROLL CALL 

APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF PREVIOUS MEETING 

APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

 

 

1. PRESENTATION by Armed Forces Committee. I01-20 (Melinda Hardy) 

 

2. RESOLUTION calling of an election on May 9, 2020 for renewal of the City’s ½% sales 

tax dedicated for streets, sewerage disposal, waste and wastewater systems.  

RES01-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

3. PRESENTATION by Beverly Gilchrist, Waste Management. I02-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

4. INTRODUCTION OF ORDINANCE declaring certain surplus movable property of the 

City of Sulphur and authorizing for the disposal thereof (equipment).  

ORD01-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

5. RESOLUTION awarding bid for the annual supply of pipe and fittings, limestone and 

asphalt mix and chemical supplies for the City.  

RES02-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

6. RESOLUTION awarding bid for the annual supply of Chlorine.  

RES03-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

7. RESOLUTION awarding bid for Request for Proposals for (30) Body Worn Cameras, 

(30) In-Car Cameras, (3) Interrogation Room Cameras and Cloud based Software and 

Video Storage for Police Department. RES04-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

8. RESOLUTION awarding low bid received for Crocker Street Drainage Improvements. 

RES05-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

9. RESOLUTION approving liquor licenses for 2020. RES06-20 (Mayor Danahay) 

 

10. RULE TO SHOW CAUSE for the condition of the following addresses: 



 

a. To condemn building or structure located at 2349 Royal Oak Lane, in 

accordance with Article IX, Section 5-286 through 5-296. (Mike Koonce) 

 

b. To condemn building or structure located at 411 South Crocker Street, in 

accordance with Article IX, Section 5-286 through 5-296. (Mike Koonce) 

 

c. To condemn building or structure located at 909 Mathilda Drive, in 

accordance with Article IX, Section 5-286 through 5-296.  

(Melinda Hardy) 

 

d. To condemn building or structure located at 1009 Elm Street, in 

accordance with Article IX, Section 5-286 through 5-296.  

(Melinda Hardy) 

 

 

11. Public Comment. 3 MINUTES PER SPEAKER - ONLY SPEAK 1 TIME PER ITEM 

 

 

ADJOURNMENT 

 

The next regular City Council meeting will be held on Monday, February 10, 2020 at 5:30 

p.m. in the Council Chambers located at 500 North Huntington Street, Sulphur, LA. 

  

In accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance to 

attend this meeting, please contact Arlene Blanchard at 527-4571, describing the assistance 

that is necessary. 
 



ORDINANCE NO.              , M-C SERIES 

 

 

AN ORDINANCE DECLARING CERTAIN SURPLUS MOVABLE PROPERTY OF 

THE CITY OF SULPHUR AND PROVIDING FOR THE DISPOSAL THEREOF 

(EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLES).  

                                                  

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Sulphur, Louisiana, the governing 

authority thereof, and in accordance with LA. R.S. 33:4712, that the following described surplus 

movable property of the City of Sulphur, not needed for public purposes, after having been duly 

advertised be declared surplus: 

             

Surplus  

 
 Information Systems 

  
TYPE QTY DESCRIPTION MODEL# SERIAL# REASON DATE 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S84339FUKCAR7WG 84339FU KCAR7WG END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S880797ULKRLMX7 880797U LKRLMX7 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCLW 2988E1U MJXVCLW END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCTL 2988E1U MJXVCTL END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCNP 2988E1U MJXVCNP END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCTR 2988E1U MJXVCTR END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCRX 2988E1U MJXVCRX END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988D9UMJZPEET 2988D9U MJZPEET END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WH4 2988E1U MJ19WH4 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCLC 2988E1U MJXVCLC END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988D9UMJZPEFV 2988D9U MJZPEFV END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WK1 2988E1U MJ19WK1 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WG5 2988E1U MJ19WG5 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCTY 2988E1U MJXVCTY END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVDKT 2988E1U MJXVDKT END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCVL 2988E1U MJXVCVL END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WH3 2988E1U MJ19WH3 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988D9UMJZPEEP 2988D9U MJZPEEP END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988A1UMJVNHPB 2988A1U MJVNHPB END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCTA 2988E1U MJXVCTA END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCLE 2988E1U MJXVCLE END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WH9 2988E1U MJ19WH9 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988D9UMJZNDHX 2988D9U MJZNDHX END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 



PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCVE 2988E1U MJXVCVE END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WK2 2988E1U MJ19WK2 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCLF 2988E1U MJXVCLF END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WG6 2988E1U MJ19WG6 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WH2 2988E1U MJ19WH2 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ29HZ5 2988E1U MJ29HZ5 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCVM 2988E1U MJXVCVM END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCTW 2988E1U MJXVCTW END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WH8 2988E1U MJ19WH8 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJ19WG7 2988E1U MJ19WG7 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988D9UMJZNDHW 2988D9U MJZNDHW END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988D9UMJZNDHR 2988D9U MJZNDHR END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988A1UMJVMPMA 2988A1U MJVMPMA END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVCNM 2988E1U MJXVCNM END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S2988E1UMJXVDAL 2988E1U MJXVDAL END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S3598E3UMJVNHCY 3598E3U MJVNHCY END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S3598E3UMJVNHCZ 3598E3U MJVNHCZ END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 

LENOVO-
1S10A90014USMJ0259CD 10A90014US MJ0259CD END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 

LENOVO-
1S10A90048USMJ02GL6T 10A90048US MJ02GL6T END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 

LENOVO-
1S10AM000AUSMJ016W57 10AM000AUS MJ016W57 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 

LENOVO-
1S10AM000AUSMJ016W5Q 10AM000AUS MJ016W5Q END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 

LENOVO-
1S10A90014USMJ01WT8L 10A90014US MJ01WT8L END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 

LENOVO-
1S10A9000SUSMG002L7E 10A9000SUS MG002L7E END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B1UMJBCVCW 4480B1U MJBCVCW END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B5UMJNPMRD 4480B5U MJNPMRD END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B1UMJZBEP6 4480B1U MJZBEP6 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B5UMJHYDWW 4480B5U MJHYDWW END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B1UMJGZLBK 4480B1U MJGZLBK END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B3UMJHMHNY 4480B3U MJHMHNY END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B1UMJZBEP4 4480B1U MJZBEP4 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B1UMJPWDH8 4480B1U MJPWDH8 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B5UMJNPKBB 4480B5U MJNPKBB END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B1UMJZBEP7 4480B1U MJZBEP7 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B5UMJNPMRL 4480B5U MJNPMRL END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-
DESKTOP 1 LENOVO-1S4480B5UMJNPHZH 4480B5U MJNPHZH END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC- 1 LENOVO-1S4480A5UMJYBPA0 4480A5U MJYBPA0 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 



DESKTOP 

PC-TABLET 1 DELL LATITUDE 10-ST2 LATITUDE 10-ST2 D3SVQT1 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-TABLET 1 DELL LATITUDE 10-ST2 LATITUDE 10-ST2 F3SVQT1 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-TABLET 1 DELL LATITUDE 10-ST2 LATITUDE 10-ST2 10SVQT1 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-TABLET 1 DELL LATITUDE 10-ST2 LATITUDE 10-ST2 5H2QQT1 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-TABLET 1 DELL LATITUDE 10-ST2 LATITUDE 10-ST2 42SVQT1 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-TABLET 1 DELL LATITUDE 10-ST2 LATITUDE 10-ST2 61SVQT1 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JSLZ81M 2HTSA20053 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 3DTYA74946 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 2JTYA35534 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 2JTYA36181 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53AUGZY1M 2CTYA77246 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53ASGZY1M 1KTSA41724 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53ASGZY1M 1JTSA38234 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 2JTYA35573 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53ASGZY1M 1KTSA41708 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53SALZYLM 3LTSA47174 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 3DTYA74799 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 3DTYA74938 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JSLZ81M 2HTSA19988 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 2ITYA25093 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 3CTYA66780 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 3DTYA74811 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53AUGZY1M 2CTYA77231 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 2HTYA19421 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53JULZY1M 2HTYA19666 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 PANASONIC TOUGHBOOK CF-53 CF-53SULZYLM 3LTYA44386 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 LENOVO 427637U 
LENOVO 
427637U R9CM976 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 LENOVO 427637U 
LENOVO 
427637U R9D5Y6M END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

PC-LAPTOP 1 HP PROBOOK 4530S 
HP PROBOOK 
4530S CNU2292BY5 END OF LIFE 12/27/2019 

 
The above-mentioned IT equipment is at end of life and has no value. It will be disposed of 

through E-recycle.     

 

  Police   

 
       



  

 Shop 
 

                                Scrap Iron         $40.00 

                                2005 GMC 1500 TRUCK   VIN#7285               $500.00 

 

 Water Department 

Bay Lights (11)       $10.00 ea 

 

           Wastewater 

Thermo Scientific Fecal Water Bath (broken) 

      Mainitowoc Ice Machine (broken) 

                  Old UV Light Transformer 

      Scrap Pile of Metal 

                  Kohler Power Systems Generator (Model 200ROZD) 

                  Transfer Switches (May just be Cabinets) 

                  Endress Hauser Auto Sampler 

                  Hach- Auto Sampler 

                  2 Der 6500 Portable Generators 

 

 

 Note* The above-mentioned items have no value and will be scrapped.  

           Water Department 

Filing Cabinet  

 

 

  Note* The above-mentioned item has no value and will be scrapped. 

 

   

 Mayor’s Office   

 

                                  JBL 500 Series 15-inch Speaker 

 

  Note* The above-mentioned item has no value and will be scrapped. 

 

 

 

 



 

  BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that Mayor Mike Danahay is authorized to dispose of the  

afore-mentioned surplus movable property and to sign all paperwork in connection therewith.  

   

  BE IT ALSO FURTHER ORDAINED that this ordinance shall become effective 

immediately upon the Mayor’s signature. 

 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED by  

the City Council of the City of  

Sulphur, Louisiana, on this ____ 

day of ___________, 2020. 

      _____________________________ 

                                                                                   MELINDA HARDY, Chairman   

 

           
       

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the   I HEREBY CERTIFY that I have received 

foregoing Ordinance has been  from the Mayor at ______ o’clock ___.m. 

presented to the Mayor on this  on this ________ day of _______________, 

____ day of ______________,  2020, the foregoing ordinance which has 

2020, at _____ o’clock ____.m.  approved/vetoed by the Mayor. 

 

__________________________  __________________________ 

ARLENE BLANCHARD, Clerk  ARLENE BLANCHARD, Clerk 

 

 



RESOLUTION NO.               ,  M-C SERIES 

 

Resolution awarding of low bid received for annual supply of pipe and fittings, 

chemicals, limestone and asphalt mix. 

 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Sulphur, Louisiana, the 

governing authority thereof, that bids for annual supply of pipe and fittings, chemicals and 

limestone and asphalt mix for the City of Sulphur were opened and read aloud in a public 

session on Friday, December 13, 2019 at 11:00 a.m. and the bids are as follows: 

 

TABULATION FOR ANNUAL SUPPLY ON LIMSTONE 

AND ASPHALT 

DECEMBER 13, 2019 

 

 

APPROXIMATELY 20 TONS 3/4” – 1” LIMESTONE 

Prairie Contractors LLC     $40.00 Cost Per Ton  

R.E Heidt Construction Co LLC    NO BID  

DP Aggregates LLC      $35.92 Cost Per Ton****  

 

APPROXIMATELY 1000 TONS ROAD BASE LIMESTONE 

Prairie Contractors LLC     $38.00 Cost Per Ton  

R.E Heidt Construction Co LLC    NO BID  

DP Aggregates LLC      $30.95 Cost Per Ton****  

 

APPROXIMATELY 600 TONS HOT ASPHALT MIX 

 

                          Per Ton  Small Load 

Prairie Contractors LLC    $91.00    $91.00 

R.E Heidt Construction Co LLC  $87.50   NO BID ****  

DP Aggregates LLC     NO BID  NO BID 

 

APPROXIMATELY 20 GALLONS EMULSIFIED CRS-2 

Prairie Contractors LLC    NO BID  

R.E Heidt Construction Co LLC    NO BID  

DP Aggregates LLC      NO BID  

 

 

AWARDED VENDOR**** 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

TABULATION FOR PIPE AND FITTINGS 

DECEMBER 13, 2019 

 

SECTION 1 PVC SCH 40 

Coburn’s Supply      $9403.59  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co.    $19472.16  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $9054.84**** 

 

SECTION 2 HAYS BRASS  

Coburn’s Supply      $19250.33****  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co.    $19908.33  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $19724.81 

 

SECTION 3 BRASS CURB, CORP, & CHECK VALVES  

Coburn’s Supply      $34380.70  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co    $26496.45****  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $27698.64 

 

SECTION 4 METER & VALVE BOXES  

Coburn’s Supply      $6364.93**** 

Lafayette Winwater Works CO.    $6517.60  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $6806.77 

 

SECTION 5 MJ FITTINGS  

Coburn’s Supply      NO BID  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co.    $643.40  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $602.28 

 

SECTION 6 F.C. CLAMPS 

Coburn’s Supply      $16340.16  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co    $15007.68**** 

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $16281.18  

 

SECTION 7 RUBBER COUPLINGS & INSERTATEES 

Coburn’s Supply      $3941.93*****  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co    $4017.25  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $4289.81 

 

SECTION 8 HYDRANTS - VALVES  

Coburn’s Supply      $11267.24  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co    $9770.00  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $9487.00**** 

 

 

 



SECTION 9 METERS  

Coburn’s Supply     $NO BID  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co.    $9383.00  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $8615.43**** 

 

SECTION 10 PIPE  

Coburn’s Supply      $6404.64  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co    $6733.60  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $6245.56****  

 

SECTION 11 SADDLES 

 
 

SECTION 12 TOOLS 

Coburn’s Supply      NO BID  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co    $5874.50  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $5742.42**** 

 

SECTION 13 PAINTS  

Coburn’s Supply      $817.50  

Lafayette Winwater Works Co    $663.00  

Louisiana Utilities Supply     $555.00**** 

 

 

AWARDED VENDOR**** 

  



TABULATION FOR  

ANNUAL SUPPLY ON CHEMICALS 

DECEMBER 13, 2019 

 

  

12 DRUMS 330 LB CAIROX FREE FLOWING POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE  

Delta Chemical Corp      $2.75 per lb   $10890.00 ex  

Shannon Chemical Corp     No BID   NO BID  

Pennco       NO BID   NO BID  

DXI Industries Inc      NO BID   NO BID  

C & L Aqua Professional Inc     $2.40 per lb   $9504.00 ex**** 

 

55 TONS 1 TON CYLINDER CHLORINE  

Delta Chemical Corp      NO BID     

Shannon Chemical Corp     NO BID     

Pennco       NO BID     

DXI Industries      NO BID     

C & L Aqua Professional Inc     NO BID    

(Since there weren’t any bids received, another bid opening was held Monday, January 13, 2020.) 

 

75,000 POUNDS ZINC ORTHOPHOSPHATE  

Delta Chemical Corp      $.61 per lb   $45750.00 ex*****  

    (Louisiana Preference) 

Shannon Chemical Corp     $.573 per lb   $42975.00 ex  

Pennco       NO BID   NO BID  

DXI Industries      NO BID   NO BID  

C & L Aqua Professional Inc     $.65 per lb   $48750.00 ex  

    (Louisiana Preference) 

 

10,000 POUNDS HYDROFLUORSILIC ACID 23% 

 
 

 

VENDOR AWARDED **** 

 

 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED by the 

      City Council of the City of Sulphur, 

      Louisiana, on this ______day of 

      ___________________, 2020. 

 

      ___________________________ 

      MELINDA HARDY, Chairman 



ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE FOR PROJECT - $610,000.00 

 
RESOLUTION NO.                 , M-C SERIES 

 

Resolution awarding low bid received for Crocker Street Drainage Improvements. 

 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Sulphur, Louisiana, the 

governing authority thereof, that bids for Crocker Street Drainage Improvements were 

opened and read aloud in an open and public bid session on Friday, December 20, 2019 at 

10:00 a.m. and bids were as follows: 

 

Company     Base Bid Amount   

 

Tanner Heavy Equipment Co., LLC  $573,691.00 

McManus Construction, LLC   $602,374.50 

Merrick, LLC     $650,634.75 

BDS Constructors, LLC   $696,880.00 

Apeck Construction, LLC   $814,431.51 

RD Spell     $971,670.00 

 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Council does hereby accept the  

recommendation of Mayor Mike Danahay and award the bid for as follows: 

 

Company     Base Bid Amount   

 

Tanner Heavy Equipment Co., LLC  $573,691.00 

 

 

 BE IT ALSO FURTHER RESOLVED that Mayor Mike Danahay is authorized to 

sign all paperwork in connection therewith. 

 

 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED by the 

      City Council of the City of Sulphur, 

      Louisiana, on this ______ day of 

      _______________________, 2020. 

 

      __________________________________ 

      MELINDA HARDY, Chairman 

 

ATTEST: 

 

____________________________ 

ARLENE BLANCHARD, Clerk 





 



 

RESOLUTION NO.           , M-C SERIES 

 

Resolution approving liquor licenses for 2020. 

 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Sulphur, Louisiana, the 

governing authority thereof, that they do hereby approve the below liquor licenses for 

2020: 

 

Name:        Content: 

 

1. Quick Shop      Class B  

2. Misses’ Grocery      Class B  

3. West Cal Arena and event Center    Class A 

4. West Cal Arena     Class A  

5. Sulphur Truckstop & Casino    Class A  

6. Sulphur Truckstop & Casino- C store   Class B    

7. Fifth Wheel Conoco     Class B  

8. Royal Palace       Class A  

9. Sundown Super saver     Class B  

10. First Stop #1      Class B 

11. Mr. Gattis      Class A   

12. The sausage Link     Class B 

13. LeBleu’s Landing     Class A 

14. EZ Mart #4415     Class B 

15. Circle K #8337     Class B 

16. Circle K #8342     Class B 

17. Circle K #8340     Class B 

18. Circle K #8339     Class B 

19. Pitt Grill      Class A  

20. Food Mart      Class B  

21. Joe’s Pizza and Pasta     Class A  

22. Cash magic winner’s choice-CS   Class B  

23. Cash magic winner’s choice    Class A  

24. American Legion Post #179    Class A 

25. Jackpot Junction Casino    Class A 

26. Market Basket #41     Class B  

27. Tobacco Plus #1     Class B 

28. Holiday Inn      Class A 

29. Brookshire Brothers #47    Class B 

30. More 4 Less #45     Class B 

31. Wal-Mart Supercenter     Class B 

32. Mae Mae’s #295     Class B 

33. Smoker’s Paradise     Class B 



34. Delta Food Mart #4      Class B 

35. Sake Japanese Inc.      Class A 

36. Circle A       Class B 

37. Yellowfin       Class B 

38. Walgreens # 10509      Class B 

39. Walgreens #2920      Class B 

40. Mission Fuel       Class B 

41. La Rumba       Class A 

42. Richard’s Boudin and Seafood    Class A 

43. The Boiling Point      Class A 

44. A & B Tobacco      Class B 

45. X- Prez Tobacco      Class B 

46. Hampton Inn       Class A  

47. Kaw-Liga’s Wooden Indian Club Inc.   Class A 

48. Kroger #747       Class B 

49. Kroger Kwik Shop #747     Class B 

50. Coconuts Bar and Grill     Class A 

51. Smurf’s Den       Class A 

52. Hollier’s Cajun Kitchen     Class A 

53. CVS Pharmacy #5612      Class B 

54. Chili’s Bar and Grill      Class A 

55. Dollar General #9397      Class B 

56. Dollar General #71      Class B 

57. Dollar General #68      Class B 

58. Maplewood Discount      Class B 

59. More 4 Less #25      Class B 

60. Casa Ole’ #48       Class A 

61. Quick Stuff        Class B 

62. Rouse’s Market #71      Class B 

63. Shop Rite #69       Class B 

64. Candlewood Suites      Class B 

65. Dollar General #8694      Class B 

66. Kyoto Japanese Steak House     Class A 

67. Express 27       Class B 

68. El Portillo, LLC      Class A 

69. Hebert Icehouse      Class A 

70. Touchdowns Sports Grill     Class A 

71. Grab N Geaux #5      Class B 

72. Grab N Geaux #7      Class B 

73. Los Ponchos Mexican Grill     Class A 

74. Sulphur Parks & Recreation – Golf Course   Class A 



 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the above liquor licenses shall be approved 

for 2020. 

 

      APPROVED AND ADOPTED by 

      the City Council of the City of 

      Sulphur, Louisiana, on this ______  

      day of _______________, 2020. 

 

      ________________________________ 

      MELINDA HARDY, Chairman 

 

ATTEST: 

 

_____________________________ 

ARLENE BLANCHARD, Clerk 
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